
 

 

 
 
 
14 August 2024 
 

Information Rights & Compliance Team 
99 Waverley Road 

St Albans 
Hertfordshire 

AL3 5TL 
 

Tel:  01727 804227 
Email: Hpft.foi@nhs.net 

 
Our Ref: FOI/05231 

 
Thank you for your request concerning Allied Health Professionals employed. 
 
Your request has been considered and processed in accordance with the requirements of the Freedom 
of Information (FOI) Act 2000. 
 
I would like to request the information of the registered Allied Health Professionals working in the 
NHS trust from the years 2018 to 2024 (each year wise). 
 

1. Total number of registered AHP staff employed in NHS 
 
We do not hold this information1.  However under Section 16 – Duty to provide advice 
and assistance we have provided the answer for HPFT.  
 
Please see attached spreadsheet as requested.   
 
Please Note:  As per the NHSE definition Psychologists are not considered as Allied 
Health Professionals, so we have not included this data.  

 
2. Total number, age, gender, ethnicity, disability status of AHP staff in each band 

 
Due to the small numbers involved once broken down by age, gender, ethnicity and disability 
status we have applied Exemption Section 40 (2) to this part of your request, because releasing 
this information could identify individuals and constitute a breach of the Data Protection Act 
(2018).  
 

4. Number of AHPs with position in trust board, their gender, age and ethnicity 
 
0 
 

5. Number of AHPs involved in research activities, their gender, age and ethnicity. 
 
The number of AHPs involved in research activities is not recorded information1. 
 

6. Profession of chief AHPs 
 
Speech and Language Therapist.  
 

Should you require further clarification, please do not hesitate to contact me.  

 
1 Section 1(1) Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled 
(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information of the description specified in the request, and 
(b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated to him. 

mailto:Hpft.foi@nhs.net


Please find enclosed an information sheet regarding copyright protection and the Trust’s complaints 
procedure in the event that you are not satisfied with the response. 
 
Yours sincerely 
 

Sue Smith 
 
Sue Smith 
Information Rights Officer 
 
Enc: Copyright Protection and Complaints Procedure Information Leaflet. 
 
If you would like to complete a short survey in relation to your Freedom of Information request please scan the QR code below 
or click here. 

 

https://secure.membra.co.uk/ExperienceHPFT/s/Survey1.aspx?id=32ab1ea2-c45e-448c-9521-f3bc3e807d45

