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Thank you for your request concerning waitlist validation and data linkage.

Your request has been considered and processed in accordance with the requirements of the Freedom
of Information (FOI) Act 2000.

I am conducting some research on waitlist validation and data linkage in the NHS. | am
particularly interested in the different techniques and solutions used for these purposes.

| was hoping you’d be able to answer the following question under the Freedom of Information

How is waitlist validation carried out in your Trusts? Please select one of the following
options: Manually / Semi-automated / Automated.

If your response was semi-automated or automated, which tools do you use? Please
specify the types of tools or software used.

How many FTEs currently work on waitlist validation and what band are they? Please
specify the number per band.

There is not a specific team that deals with waitlist validation. Each team is responsible for their

How has your FTE count working on waitlist validation increased in the past 2-3 years?
Please provide an estimate if you do not have the exact number.

Act:
1.

Manually.
a.

Not applicable.
2.

own waiting list.
3.

Not applicable.

In the past 12 months, approximately how long has the waitlist validation process taken?
Please provide an estimate if you do not have the exact number.

This information is not recorded".

" Section 1(1) Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled
(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information of the description specified in the request, and
(b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated to him.
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What data quality issues have been identified the most frequently as part of the waitlist
validation process? Please select those that apply from the list below:

Decision to admit but no waiting list entry

Missing waiting list or pathway information (e.g. due date, intended procedure)

Patients on an admitted waiting list without an active RTT (Referral to Treatment Pathway)
clock

Past TCI (To Come In) dates

Potential duplicates

Other - please specify

Please note that Hertfordshire Partnership University NHS Foundation Trust is a provider of
mental health and specialist learning disability services; each team will do their own version of
waiting list validation by looking to see if any breaches of the KPI are legitimate breaches or data
quality errors.

What are your current approaches to linking data? Please select one of the following
options: Manually or semi-automated / Automated

Semi-automated

What is the proportion of data linkage that is manual and automated? Please provide an
estimate if you do not have the exact number.

If automated, what tools are used? Please provide the name of the tools.

If manual, what tools are used e.g. R, data bricks? Please provide the name of the tools.
This information is not recorded".

It is not possible to estimate the proportion of the data linkage that is performed manually versus
automatically. Some of the data linkages are done manually through Excel while some
automations are done through Structured Query Language (SQL) and R(This is a statistical
programming tool).

Currently, is the data linking process cumbersome? Please select one option: Yes/No
Yes

And does it take away from people’s everyday role? Please select one option: Yes/No

Yes

Should you require further clarification, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Please find enclosed an information sheet regarding copyright protection and the Trust’s complaints
procedure in the event that you are not satisfied with the response.

Yours sincerely

Deborah Anthony

Information Rights Officer

Enc: Copyright Protection and Complaints Procedure Information Leaflet.

If you would like to complete a short survey in relation to your Freedom of Information request please click here.
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