
 

 

 
 
 
14 October 2024 
 

Information Rights & Compliance Team 
99 Waverley Road 

St Albans 
Hertfordshire 

AL3 5TL 
 

Tel:  01727 804227 
Email: Hpft.foi@nhs.net 

 
Our Ref: FOI/05344 

 
Thank you for your request concerning HR and Finance systems. 
 
Your request has been considered and processed in accordance with the requirements of the Freedom 
of Information (FOI) Act 2000. 
 
Would you kindly provide me with the following information regarding your Finance/HR contracts: 
Which ERP (Enterprise Resource Management)/Finance Provider is used as your financial 
solution? 
 
1. Which provider is used as your HR and Payroll solution? 

 

 Provider 

HR Electronic Staff Record (ESR) 

Payroll Outsourced 

 
2. What are the total and annual contract values for each of your systems? 

 

 Annual Spend 

HR  Interface Only - £5k 

Payroll £270k 

 
3. When do your contracts expire? 

 

 Contract End Date 

HR National requirement - Rolling 

Payroll Ongoing 

 
4. Do you have any planned upgrades of the software? 
a. If so, when? 

 
This information is not recorded1. 
 

5. Are you planning to go to market for a different HR or Finance system? 
a. If so, when?  

 
This information is not recorded1.  
 

 
1 Section 1(1) Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled 
(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information of the description specified in the request, and 
(b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated to him. 

mailto:Hpft.foi@nhs.net


6. Who is the person responsible for your HR or Finance system? Please provide: Full name, 
job title and contact information, if possible. 
 
In an effort to ensure that the Trust does not receive unsolicited communications resulting in direct 
marketing purposes and/or any potential malicious malware, the Trust does not routinely publish 
the names or contact details of staff other than those publicly available through our Trust website 
as exercised in individuals GDPR rights.  
 

Should you require further clarification, please do not hesitate to contact me. 
 
Please find enclosed an information sheet regarding copyright protection and the Trust’s complaints 
procedure in the event that you are not satisfied with the response. 
 
Yours sincerely 
 

Sue Smith 
 
Sue Smith 
Information Rights Officer 
 
Enc: Copyright Protection and Complaints Procedure Information Leaflet. 
 
If you would like to complete a short survey in relation to your Freedom of Information request please scan the QR code below 
or click here. 

 

https://www.hpft.nhs.uk/about-us/our-board-of-directors/
https://secure.membra.co.uk/ExperienceHPFT/s/Survey1.aspx?id=32ab1ea2-c45e-448c-9521-f3bc3e807d45

