
 

 

 
 
 
03 September 2025 
 

Information Rights & Compliance Team 
99 Waverley Road 

St Albans 
Hertfordshire 

AL3 5TL 
 

Tel:  01727 804227 
Email: Hpft.foi@nhs.net 

 
Our Ref: FOI/05756 

 
 
 
Thank you for your request concerning CAMHS services. 
 
Your request has been considered and processed in accordance with the requirements of the Freedom 
of Information (FOI) Act 2000. 
 

I am writing to request information under the FOI Act about your CAMHS 
services/neurodevelopmental assessment services for Children and Young People. If you 
cannot provide this information, please tell me where I can find it.  
Please tell me: 

 
1. The number of young people on your waiting list for a first appointment (assessment) as of 

the date of this email or nearest available.  
74 

 
2. The average length of time young people are currently waiting between referral and first 

appointment (assessment). 
15 Days 
 

3. The average length of time young people are currently waiting between initial referral and first 
therapeutic intervention. 
We do not hold this information1.  
 

4. How many young people assessed were not offered follow up treatment at Camhs in the year 
2024-25, as a number and a proportion of the total of young people assessed? 
We do not hold this information 1. 
 

5.  The longest time any young person has been on your current waiting list (as of the date of 
the receipt of this email or nearest) 

       126 Days 
 
6.  The average wait between referral and assessment for neurodevelopmental/neurodiverse 

conditions on the date of this request or nearest available data. 
452 Days 
 

7.  The number of young people on the waiting list for  neurodevelopmental/neurodiverse 
assessments on the date of this request or nearest available data. 

       2,864 
 

1 Section 1(1) Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled (a) to be informed in  
writing by the public authority whether it holds information of the description specified in the request, and (b) if that is  
the case, to have that information communicated to him.  
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Should you require further clarification, please do not hesitate to contact me. 
 
Please find enclosed an information sheet regarding copyright protection and the Trust’s complaints 
procedure in the event that you are not satisfied with the response. 
 
Yours sincerely 

 
Deborah Anthony 
Deborah Anthony 
 
Information Rights Officer 
 
Enc: Copyright Protection and Complaints Procedure Information Leaflet. 
 
If you would like to complete a short survey in relation to your Freedom of Information request please click here. 
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