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Thank you for your request concerning Covid 19 Vaccines.
Your request has been considered and processed in accordance with the requirements of the Freedom
of Information (FOI) Act 2000.
The first twelve questions below were originally addressed to the Health Secretary, Sajid Javid
MP, in the video, which can be seen here: https://www.ukcitizen.org/questions-celebrities-areasking-the-government-to-answer-about-covid/. I now address the same questions to you.
A response to Question 13 is critical and, after eighteen months on the market, a clear answer
should be straightforward.
1.

Why is the British Government continuing to ignore hundreds, if not thousands, of
vaccine injured people currently seeking justice and acknowledgment?
(Matt Hoy, Former UB40 vocalist feat AA)
Under Section 1(1) we can confirm that we do not hold this information1; nor can we answer for
the British Government.

2.

Why is the government offering a maximum of just £120,000 in taxpayer funded
compensation for deaths and serious injuries from Covid-19 vaccinations when the
manufacturers made billions?
(Sue Cook, Writer/broadcaster)
We do not hold this information; nor can we answer for the British Government.

3.

Why were the people of the UK not told that the Covid vaccines are experimental and
have not completed their clinical trials?
(Dr Tess Lawrie, Director E-BMC)
We do not hold this information. We are not responsible for informing the people of the UK of
anything regarding Covid vaccines.

1

Section 1(1) Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled
(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information of the description specified in the request, and
(b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated to him.

4.

Why is the government recommending children as young as five get a Covid vaccine
when Covid poses very little threat to them, and the vast majority have already had Covid
and reports of injuries from vaccines are growing?
(Dr Anthony Hinton, Consultant Surgeon)
We do not hold this information; nor can we answer for the British Government.

5.

There is growing evidence in the US of malpractice and fraud by Pfizer in its
vaccine trials. When is the UK Government going to investigate this given that
Pfizer products are key to the vaccination program in the UK?
(Right Said Fred, British Band)
We do not hold this information; nor can we answer for the British Government .

6.

How can someone who believes that they have been vaccine injured get help for their
condition if their doctor refuses to acknowledge it?
(John Bowe, British & Charity Founder)
We do not hold this information.

7.

Given the recent warning by the European Medicines Agency that frequent boosters
might impair people’s immune system does the Government plan, this winter, to give
boosters to people at low risk from Covid?
(James Freeman, Former British MEP)
We do not hold this information; nor can we answer for the British Government.

8.

Why was there no cost/benefit analysis before implementing lockdowns? Many experts
raised concerns right from the outset but were silenced.
(Lange, Musician/DJ)
We do not hold this information. We were not responsible for conducting a cost/benefit analysis
before implementing lockdowns.

9.

Healthy children are at a statistically zero risk of dying from Covid-19, so what was the
equation that you used to green light giving the jab with demonstrable harms to the
under 18s?
(Bev Turner, Broadcaster/campaigner)
We do not hold this information.
receiving the Covid-19 jab.

10.

We did not conduct a green light equation for the under 18s

Why were pregnant women told it was safe for them to get the jab when the Pfizer initial
data showed that it is not safe in pregnancy?
(Dr Kat Lindley, Family Physician)
We do not hold this information.. We did not inform pregnant women it was safe for them to get
the jab.

11.

As Health Minister, did you choose to either not run a long term control group for the
Covid vaccines or an active monitoring system to look for side effects or did you just not
think about it?
(Dr Steve James, NHS Consultant)
We do not hold this information. I am not the Health Minister nor do they work for this Trust.

12.

Given the patients were being “vaccinated’ with a non-therapeutic do you believe that
enough information was given to the patients on safety, efficacy, and adverse events to
allow informed consent at the point of injection?
(Dr David Cartland, General Practitioner)
The right of access created by the Freedom of Information Act only applies to recorded
information. This does not include requests asking for a person’s beliefs, opinions or general
advice.

13.

Are the Pfizer-BioNTech and Moderna mRNA “vaccines” gene therapies? Please provide
evidence in support of your answer. Here is an article that you may find of relevance in
determining your response. https://www.mdpi.com/1467-3045/44/3/73
We do not hold this information.

Should you require further clarification, please do not hesitate to contact me.
Please find enclosed an information sheet regarding copyright protection and the Trust’s complaints
procedure in the event that you are not satisfied with the response.
Yours sincerely

Sue Smith
Sue Smith
Information Rights Officer
Enc: Copyright Protection and Complaints Procedure Information Leaflet.
If you would like to complete a short survey in relation to your Freedom of Information request please scan the QR code below
or click here.

