
 

 

 
 
 
3 October 2023 
 

Information Rights & Compliance Team 
99 Waverley Road 

St Albans 
Hertfordshire 

AL3 5TL 
 

Tel:  01727 804227 
Email: Hpft.foi@nhs.net 

 
Our Ref: FOI/04755 

 
Thank you for your request concerning Oxehealth surveillance technology. 
 
Your request has been considered and processed in accordance with the requirements of the Freedom 
of Information (FOI) Act 2000. 
 
1. Does your Trust currently use Oxehealth/Oxevision or any other video surveillance or 

technology enabled vital signs monitoring within patient residences (including seclusion 
suites, patient bedrooms etc.) 
 
Yes. 
 

2. Where within patient residencies is this technology located (eg. Seclusion rooms, patient 
bedrooms, patient bathrooms) 

 
The monitor is located in the bedroom of our 136 Suite. 
 

3. Copies of patient leaflets or information sheets related to Oxehealth/Oxevision or any other 
video surveillance or technology enabled vital signs monitoring. 
 
We do not hold this information1. 
 

4. Your organisation’s Equality Impact Assessments in relation to Oxehealth/Oxevision or 
any other video surveillance or technology enabled vital signs monitoring. 
 
We do not hold this Information1. 
 

5. Your organisation’s risk assessment in relation Oxehealth/Oxevision or any other video 
surveillance or technology enabled vital signs monitoring. 
 
We do not hold this Information1. 
 

6. Your organisation’s operational and organisational policies and procedures relating to 
Oxehealth/Oxevision or any other video surveillance or technology enabled vital signs 
monitoring, including details of patient consent. 

 
We do not hold this information1. 
 

 
1 Section 1(1) Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled 
(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information of the description specified in the request, and 
(b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated to him 
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7. Details of which services have the ability to use Oxehealth/Oxevision or any other video 
surveillance or technology enabled vital signs monitoring. (ie. Secure Services, 
Psychiatric Intensive Care Services, CAMHS etc.) 
 
We do not have the ability to use Oxehealth / Oxevision elsewhere in the trust at present. 
 

8. Details about the decision-making process relating to adopting Oxehealth/Oxevision or 
any other video surveillance or technology enabled vital signs monitoring. 
 
We were approached by a representative from Oxevision who presented to the Medical Devices 
Committee (MDC) and the action from this was to visit a site where the device is in use.  
 

9. Records of any training provided in using this technology.  
 
We do not hold this information1.  Under Section 16 – Duty to provide advice and assistance we 
can confirm all staff have been trained in the use of this monitor.  

 
10. Details of where footage / information is stored 

 
Footage is stored on a dedicated site server.  
 

11. Any Data Protection Impact Assessments for Oxehealth/Oxevision or any other video 
surveillance or technology enabled vital signs monitoring. 
 
Please see attached our DPIA01 Forms. 

 
Should you require further clarification, please do not hesitate to contact me. 
 
Please find enclosed an information sheet regarding copyright protection and the Trust’s complaints 
procedure in the event that you are not satisfied with the response. 
 
Yours sincerely 
 

Sue Smith 
 
Sue Smith 
Information Rights Officer 
 
Enc: Copyright Protection and Complaints Procedure Information Leaflet. 
 
If you would like to complete a short survey in relation to your Freedom of Information request please scan the QR code below 
or click here. 

 

https://secure.membra.co.uk/ExperienceHPFT/s/Survey1.aspx?id=32ab1ea2-c45e-448c-9521-f3bc3e807d45

