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Information Rights & Compliance Team 
99 Waverley Road 

St Albans 
Hertfordshire 

AL3 5TL 
 

Tel:  01727 804227 
Email: Hpft.foi@nhs.net 

 
 Our Ref: FOI/05200 

 
 
 
Thank you for your request concerning Clinical System Team Structure. 
 
Your request has been considered and processed in accordance with the requirements of the Freedom 
of Information (FOI) Act 2000. 
 
1. Please outline the structure of your organisation's clinical systems team (e.g. SystmOne 

trainers, service desk staff, configurations specialists, business change analysts, 
management/project manager), can you include number of each roles e.g. 3 business 
change analysts, number of job bandings for each role, an estimate of staff supported, 
service users, and the number of services supported. 

 
We do not hold such an Organisation Team Structure chart1. 
 
Please be advised that the FOIA does not oblige a public authority to create information to 
answer a request if the requested information is not held or exist. The FOIA duty is to only 
provide the recorded information held. 

 
2. Can you list distinct care settings you support e.g. community, mental health, inpatient, 

community hospital, minor injury units, urgent care settings, emergency departments 
etc. 

 
This information is already in the public domain, please follow this link to our website2. 

 
3. If your clinical systems team don’t manage projects, please provide info on numbers of 

business change specialists and project managers that will typically support your 
clinical systems e.g. SystmOne changes. 

 
Please see the answer to question 1. 

 
Should you require further clarification, please do not hesitate to contact me. 
 

  

 
1 Section 1(1) Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled 
(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information of the description specified in the request, and 
(b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated to him. 
 
2 Section 21 – Information is available through other means 

mailto:Hpft.foi@nhs.net
https://www.hpft.nhs.uk/services/


Please find enclosed an information sheet regarding copyright protection and the Trust’s complaints 
procedure in the event that you are not satisfied with the response. 
 
Yours sincerely 
 

Sue Smith 
 
Sue Smith 
Information Rights Officer 
 
Enc: Copyright Protection and Complaints Procedure Information Leaflet. 
 
If you would like to complete a short survey in relation to your Freedom of Information request please scan the QR code below 
or click here. 

 

https://secure.membra.co.uk/ExperienceHPFT/s/Survey1.aspx?id=32ab1ea2-c45e-448c-9521-f3bc3e807d45

