
 

 

 
 
 
29 May 2024 
 

Information Rights & Compliance Team 
99 Waverley Road 

St Albans 
Hertfordshire 

AL3 5TL 
 

Tel:  01727 804227 
Email: Hpft.foi@nhs.net 

 
 Our Ref: FOI/05064-2 

Thank you for your request concerning Psychiatrists - Stop Smoking Training. 
 
Your request has been considered and processed in accordance with the requirements of the Freedom 
of Information (FOI) Act 2000. 
 
Original Request 
1. Of the 700 total, how many were psychiatrists, and how many psychiatrists worked at 

Watford General Hospital. 
2. In the following four years 2014-2015, 2015-2016, 2016-2017, 2017-2018 how many 

psychiatrists were employed by HPFT, how many worked at Watford General Hospital 
and of these how many had completed or had not completed the Herts Stop Smoking 
Service Brief Intervention training  

3.  Please provide a breakdown of these figures by training delivery mode e.g. E-Learning, 
Face-to-Face etc 

 
I believe your response may be incorrect.  I refer to: 
 

• NICE PH48 Smoking cessation in secondary care: acute, maternity and mental health 
services Nov 2013 says directors and managers in mental health services should 
“ensure all frontline staff are trained to deliver advice around stopping smoking” and 
“ensure online training can be completed and updated annual as part of NHS mandatory 
training…” 
 

• HPFT Smoke Free Policy v4.1 states managers and team leaders will ensure “staff have 
received smoking cessation training”. 
 

• HPFT Nicotine Replacement Therapy for Inpatients version 3.  Page 12 under a heading 
of “STANDARD” (which is a must requirement) and lists Brief Interventions Training for 
all clinical staff working in direct care. 

 
These references above contradict your response that the training was not mandatory. 
I look forward to receiving a revised response to FOI 5064 with answers to questions 1, question 
2 (except for a breakdown of numbers for Watford General Hospital for the reason you have 
explained), and question 3. 
 
 
  

mailto:Hpft.foi@nhs.net


1. Of the 700 total, how many were psychiatrists, and how many psychiatrists worked at 
Watford General Hospital. 
 
We have been unable to locate information regarding staff trained to give brief intervention 
advice from 2014/15 onwards because this information is not held in a reportable manner on our 
Electronic Staff Record (ESR). 
 
In order to provide you with this information would involve contacting all the Clinical Leads and 
then going through every Psychiatrists personal file to ascertain if they had or had not attended 
this training.   
 
In addition not all Psychiatrists employed at the time will still be with the Trust. 
 
For example in 2017/18 the Trust employed 179 Psychiatrists and it is estimated to provide the 
data would take 10 minutes per record to scrutinise i.e. 31.83 hours at £25 per hour = £795.83  
therefore we have applied exemption Section 12. 
 
In addition, we do not believe reading through individuals HR records for the purpose of a FOI 
request would be in line with the GDPR Data Protection Principles or the Caldicott Principles. 
 

2. In the following four years 2014-2015, 2015-2016, 2016-2017, 2017-2018 how many 
psychiatrists were employed by HPFT, how many worked at Watford General Hospital 
and of these how many had completed or had not completed the Herts Stop Smoking 
Service Brief Intervention training  
 
As explained under question 1 this is information is not recorded1.  We have no reportable 
records of staff completing the Hertfordshire Stop Smoking Service Brief Intervention training in 
2014-15, 2015-16, 2016-17 or 2017-18 on our ESR.   
 

3. Please provide a breakdown of these figures by training delivery mode e.g. E-Learning, 
Face-to-Face etc 
 
Not applicable.  
 
Thank you for bringing to our attention the inaccuracy of our Smoke Free policy and we can 
confirm that this policy is currently being reviewed; The Hertfordshire Stop Smoking Service 
Brief Intervention training was not mandatory, therefore not recorded in a reportable manner.  
 

Should you require further clarification or link to discuss payment, please do not hesitate to contact me. 
 
Please find enclosed an information sheet regarding copyright protection and the Trust’s complaints 
procedure in the event that you are not satisfied with the response. 
 
Yours sincerely 

Sue Smith 
Sue Smith 
Information Rights Officer 
Enc: Copyright Protection and Complaints Procedure Information Leaflet. 
If you would like to complete a short survey in relation to your Freedom of Information request please scan the QR code below 
or click here. 

 

https://secure.membra.co.uk/ExperienceHPFT/s/Survey1.aspx?id=32ab1ea2-c45e-448c-9521-f3bc3e807d45

