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Thank you for your request concerning Psychiatrist locum agency staff.

Your request has been considered and processed in accordance with the requirements of the Freedom
of Information (FOI) Act 2000.

For all psychiatry grades (e.g. Consultant, SAS) and all sub-specialties (e.g. General Adult, Old
Age, CAMHS) for the periods 2021/22, 2022/23, 2023/2024 and April to September 2024:

1. Please could you provide the data for total spend, for each locum agency used, divided
between on and off framework.

Specialty: Adult Older Adult CYPMH LD
Grade: No Band No Band No Band No Band
Consultant 237,317 5,894 319,632 0.00
Spend :
21/22 Specialty 101,372 0.00 14,957 19,257
Doctor
Consultant 189,141 14.754 97,375 45,051
Spend :
22/23 Specialty 327,213 0.00 68,817 0.00
Doctor
Consultant 315,797 30,932 0.00 79,794
Spend :
23/24 Specialty 350,300 0.00 33,077 0.00
Doctor
Spend Consultant 173,982 0.00 0.00 55,278
24/25 April -
to Sept g ggig‘;"w 230,003 0.00 65,318 1,901

We cannot answer the above question by agency as the information is not held in a reportable
manner! and the Trust has not worked off framework in the above years.

1 Section 1(1) Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled
(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information of the description specified in the request, and
(b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated to him.
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2. Please confirm the total number of agency locum psychiatrists working per month, for each
agency supplier divided between on and off framework.

Please see the attached spreadsheet for answers.
Due to the small numbers involved we have applied Exemption Section 40 (2) to this part of your
request. This is because entries of 5 or less are considered sufficiently small enough to be potentially

identifiable data. On this basis, this information is exempt from the duty to publish.

3. Please confirm the total number of hours worked by agency locum psychiatrists per month,
for each agency supplier divided between on and off framework.

Please refer to answer in question 2.

4. Please confirm the total number of unfilled vacancies (excluding Locum filled posts) per
month.

This information is not held2. The right of access created by the Freedom of Information Act only
applies to recorded information. This does not include requests asking for a person’s wishes,
opinions or general advice.

Should you require further clarification, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Please find enclosed an information sheet regarding copyright protection and the Trust’s complaints
procedure in the event that you are not satisfied with the response.

Yours sincerely

Amara Chukwurah
Information Rights Officer

Enc: Copyright Protection and Complaints Procedure Information Leaflet.

If you would like to complete a short survey in relation to your Freedom of Information request please click here.

2 Section 1(1) Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled
(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information of the description specified in the request, and
(b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated to him.
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