
 

 

 
 
 
03 September 2025 
 

Information Rights & Compliance Team 
99 Waverley Road 

St Albans 
Hertfordshire 

AL3 5TL 
 

Tel:  01727 804227 
Email: Hpft.foi@nhs.net 

 
Our Ref: FOI/05817 

 
 
 
Thank you for your request concerning fire dampers. 
 
Your request has been considered and processed in accordance with the requirements of the Freedom 
of Information (FOI) Act 2000. 
 
Please answer the following questions: 
  
1. Are the Fire Dampers currently on contract for the inspection and maintenance?  

Yes 
  
2.       If yes, please confirm the following: 
         Due date for contract end  

We do not hold this information1 
 
Fire Dampers form part of a very large Hard FM (Facility Management) contract. Our Hard FM 
provider is responsible for managing the Fire Dampers Contracts (procurement/tender/ 
immobilization/ termination). 

 
Actual contract spend. 

           We are unable to provide this breakdown as this is part of the main Hard FM service provision . 
 
2. What route to market used to obtain these services (a) open tender (b) framework - if yes, 

which one?  
We do not hold this information1.  Our Hard FM provider is responsible for this. 

           
3. Are the fire dampers currently maintained by an external contractor? If yes, please provide 

which contractor?  
Yes. 
 Dalkia https://dalkia.co.uk/ 

  
4. Finally, please advise names and contact details of any individuals (outside of procurement) 

responsible for this contract including your Estates Manager (b) Health & Safety 
Compliance Manager (c) Fire Officer?  
Alan Morley ,our Associate Director of Estates & Facilities  is responsible for our Hard FM Contract.  

 
 
Should you require further clarification, please do not hesitate to contact me. 

 
1 Section 1(1) Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled (a) to be informed in  
writing by the public authority whether it holds information of the description specified in the request, and (b) if that is  
the case, to have that information communicated to him . 

mailto:Hpft.foi@nhs.net
https://dalkia.co.uk/


 
Please find enclosed an information sheet regarding copyright protection and the Trust’s complaints 
procedure in the event that you are not satisfied with the response. 
 
Yours sincerely 
 
Deborah Anthony 
Deborah Anthony 
 
Information Rights Officer 
 
Enc: Copyright Protection and Complaints Procedure Information Leaflet. 
 
If you would like to complete a short survey in relation to your Freedom of Information request please click here. 
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