
 

 

 
 
 
16 October 2025 
 

Information Rights & Compliance Team 
99 Waverley Road 

St Albans 
Hertfordshire 

AL3 5TL 
 

Tel:  01727 804227 
Email: Hpft.foi@nhs.net 

 
Our Ref: FOI/05826 

 
 
 
Thank you for your request concerning our Trust’s translation and interpreting services. 
 
Your request has been considered and processed in accordance with the requirements of the Freedom of 
Information (FOI) Act 2000. 
 
Please include the following information for the following financial years 2022/23, 2023/24 

and 2024/25: 
 
1. Trust’s overall spending on Translation and Interpreting Services 

The response to this request is already in the public domain . Please follow this link to 
FOI /05675 & FOI /052251 .  
 

2. Total translators employed by the Trust. 
We do not hold this information as we do not directly employ interpreters  2.  
 

3. The hourly pay for in-house interpreters 
Please see response to question 2. 
 

4. What languages do they cover  
The languages covered by interpreters are as below in the response to question 5  . 
      

5. Total number of in-person/face to face interpreting sessions booked (break down 
by language and clinical area) 
Please see the total numbers of in- person session booked broken down by languages 
below . 
 
We are unable to split the breakdown  into clinical areas as we do not hold this 
information 2 .  

 
Languages Total bookings 
Farsi / Persian 724 
Arabic 387 
Turkish 353 
Polish 301 

 
1 Section 21 – Information is available through other means .  
2 Section 1(1) Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled (a) to be informed in  
writing by the public authority whether it holds information of the description specified in the request, and (b) if that is  
the case, to have that information communicated to him . 

mailto:Hpft.foi@nhs.net
https://www.hpft.nhs.uk/media/ijub5xx2/2025-06-13-5675-disclosure-log-response.pdf
https://www.hpft.nhs.uk/media/2l4fo2sv/2024-09-23-5225-disclosure-log-final-response.pdf


Albanian 276 
BSL / British Sign Language 219 
Urdu 191 
Bangla / Bengali 184 
Portuguese 183 
Russian 170 
Romanian 144 
Spanish 139 
Tamil 135 
Afghani Pashto / Northern Pashto 113 
Sylheti 89 
Ukrainian 87 
Chinese-Mandarin / Mandarin Chinese 80 
Cantonese / Yue Chinese 69 
Panjabi 68 
Bulgarian 62 
Italian 59 
Modern Greek 57 
Twi 43 
Sinhala 36 
Central Kurdish 33 
Kurdish Sorani / Kurdish 33 
Dari 30 
Pahari-Pothwari 22 
Swahili 19 
Hindi 19 
Hungarian 17 
Slovak 15 
Tigrynian / Tigrinya 14 
French 11 
Gujarati 11 
Lithuanian 10 
Sudanese Arabic 8 
Vietnamese 8 
Thai 7 
Syrian Arabic 7 
Shona 6 
Telugu 6 
Amharic 6 
Lebanese Arabic 6 



Iranian Persian 5 or less3 
Korean 5 or less 
Georgian 5 or less 
Azerbaijani 5 or less 
Kurdish Kurmanji / Northern Kurdish 5 or less 
Somali 5 or less 
German 5 or less 
Algerian Arabic 5 or less 
Wollof / Gambian Wolof 5 or less 
Moroccan Arabic 5 or less 
Malayalam 5 or less 
Egyptian Arabic 5 or less 
Latvian 5 or less 
Greek languages 5 or less 

 
Entries of 5 or less are considered sufficiently small enough to be potentially identifiable 
data. On this basis, part of the information you requested is exempt from the duty to 
publish 3. 
 

6. How many appointments or procedures have had to be rescheduled/cancelled 
due to interpreter . 
Please see response to question 2.  

 
Should you require further clarification, please do not hesitate to contact me. 
 
Please find enclosed an information sheet regarding copyright protection and the Trust’s complaints 
procedure in the event that you are not satisfied with the response. 
 
Yours sincerely 
 
Deborah Anthony 
Deborah Anthony 
 
Information Rights Officer 
 
Enc: Copyright Protection and Complaints Procedure Information Leaflet. 
 
If you would like to complete a short survey in relation to your Freedom of Information request please click here. 
 

 
3 Section 40(2) - Personal Data has been applied. This is because by releasing this information could identify  
individual(s) and constitute a breach of the Data Protection Act (2018) . 

https://forms.office.com/Pages/DesignPageV2.aspx?origin=RevampFRE&subpage=design&id=slTDN7CF9UeyIge0jXdO4_oPtQG0LtFJkSkFwsLCbytUN0w0Tlc3QzVTRDRJUjZBNUxYUkFKUVA2Ny4u&analysis=false&topview=Preview

