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Thank you for your request concerning digital therapies adult mental health. 
 
Your request has been considered and processed in accordance with the requirements of the Freedom 
of Information (FOI) Act 2000. 
 

1. Please state any digital technologies, e-therapies, internet-delivered therapies, online or digital 
therapies, digitally enabled therapies or digital therapeutics for adult mental health problems 
that your Trust has procured, contracted or are paid for by the service for use by service users. 
For example, these might include, but are not limited to, internet-delivered cognitive behaviour 
(CBT) with or without therapist support, smartphone applications, web applications or 
programmes, wearables (including devices or sensors) or extended reality technologies (i.e. 
virtual reality, augmented reality). Format this as a list indicating which have been procured, 
contracted or paid for by the service.     
 
IESO Health, Silvercloud and KOA Health. 
 

2. Additionally, please state any digital technologies, e-therapies, internet-delivered therapies, 
online or digital therapies, digitally enabled therapies or digital therapeutics for adult mental 
health problems that your Trust uses or recommends to service users. For example, these might 
include, but are not limited to, internet-delivered cognitive behaviour (CBT) with or without 
therapist support, smartphone applications, web applications or programmes, wearables 
(including devices or sensors) or extended reality technologies (i.e. virtual reality, augmented 
reality). Format this as a list indicating which are recommended and which are used by the 
Trust.     
Please note: we distinguish between 1) procured, contracted or paid for by the service and 2) 
used and recommended based on the following:     

a. Procured, contracted or paid for by the service - these are technologies from suppliers that 
have been formally agreed and paid for by the Trust to use in service.    

b. Used or recommended - these are technologies that have not been formally procured or 
contracted but might be suggested to service users (e.g. a list of technologies given upon 
referral, while on the waitlist for treatment, upon treatment commencement or completion) or 
used by clinicians in service.      

We do not have a definitive list of recommendations. Individuals may recommend technologies/apps 
specifically to the  service user’s need. 
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3. For the period of 2023/24, please provide any data monitoring information you collect on the 
technologies listed above. For example, the number of people that have been recommended or 
reported using the technologies, how long they continued to use the technology or whether there 
was a reported benefit from their use. Please state where this data is collected from (e.g. the 
technology providers or from the service).     

  
This information is not recorded1.  Please be advised that the FOIA does not oblige a public authority to 
create information to answer a request if the requested information is not held or exist. The FOIA duty is 
to only provide the recorded information held. 

 
4. Please list any Talking Therapies (formerly known as IAPT) providers that run services on your 

behalf or in connection with your Trust.  
  
 Not applicable. 
    
5. If these services are not run directly by the NHS please state who runs them and what they are 

(e.g. Social Enterprise, Limited Company, third sector group).     
 
 Not applicable. 
 
6. Please state any organisations or third parties (e.g. ORCHA) you have partnered with or 

commissioned to create or provide an app library.  
 
 We do not have a Library app at this Trust. 
     
7. For the period 2023/24 please state the total number of people your Trust treated for common 

mental health problems (see definition: here), including how many were treated for each 
problem.     

  
  

Diagnosis Number of Service Users 

Depression 6,298 

Agoraphobia 208 

Social Anxiety Disorder 519 

Specific phobias 255 

Panic disorder 423 

Generalized Anxiety Disorder 4,424 

Mixed anxiety and depressive 
disorder 161 

Obsessive-compulsive disorder 579 

Post-traumatic stress disorder 864 

Health Anxiety 360 

Body Dysmorphic Disorder (BDD) 20 

 
Should you require further clarification, please do not hesitate to contact me. 
 

 
1 Section 1(1) Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled 

(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information of the description specified in the request, and 
(b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated to him. 

 

https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.england.nhs.uk%2Fmental-health%2Fadults%2Fnhs-talking-therapies%2F&data=05%7C02%7Chpft.foi%40nhs.net%7Cfe99375f04b84b2b1bf508dd18764b61%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C0%7C638693618553113093%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJFbXB0eU1hcGkiOnRydWUsIlYiOiIwLjAuMDAwMCIsIlAiOiJXaW4zMiIsIkFOIjoiTWFpbCIsIldUIjoyfQ%3D%3D%7C0%7C%7C%7C&sdata=hkvb7F4xRxgX72zwQK1qy2f2q1Kv1IKFgmtcAyvanJs%3D&reserved=0


Please find enclosed an information sheet regarding copyright protection and the Trust’s complaints 
procedure in the event that you are not satisfied with the response. 
 
Yours sincerely 

 

Amara Chukwurah 
Information Rights Officer 
 
Enc: Copyright Protection and Complaints Procedure Information Leaflet. 
 
If you would like to complete a short survey in relation to your Freedom of Information request please click here. 
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