
 

 

 
 
 
04 November 2025 
 

Information Rights & Compliance Team 
99 Waverley Road 

St Albans 
Hertfordshire 

AL3 5TL 
 

Tel:  01727 804227 
Email: Hpft.foi@nhs.net 

 
Our Ref: FOI/05877 

 
 
 
Thank you for your request concerning our Trust’s post room. 
 
Your request has been considered and processed in accordance with the requirements of the Freedom 
of Information (FOI) Act 2000. 
 
I am writing to request information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 and would be 
grateful if you could answer the following.  
 

1. How many letters in total were sent by the Trust between 1st October 2024 - 30th September 
2025?  
We do not hold this information 1.  
 

    Of those, how many and what percentage were: 
 
a) Posted locally (i.e. franked and sent out by the post room): 
     We do not have a post room. Each of our Trust’s site has a franking machine (usually managed by 

reception) where letters can be posted. 
 
b) Sent via hybrid mail (i.e. posted by your hybrid mail supplier): 
      70,940 hybrid mails were sent .  
 
c) Sent digitally (i.e. published and read by the recipient via the NHS app): 
     Zero as we are not live on the NHS app. 
 

2 . Of those letters posted locally or sent via hybrid mail between 1st October 2024 - 30th September 
2025, how many were sent 1st class? 

 b.  Of those letters posted locally or sent via hybrid mail between 1st October 2024 - 30th 
September 2025, how many were sent via 2nd class? 
   For questions 2a and 2b ,the response is zero as all letters are sent via business class. 
 

3. If you use a hybrid mail service: 
a.    As of September 2025, who is your hybrid mail provider?  

 This is contracted via Cisco (previously Healthcare Communications) . 
 

 
b. Which frameworks do you use to tender for hybrid mail? 

 
1 Section 1(1) Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled (a) to be informed in  
writing by the public authority whether it holds information of the description specified in the request, and (b) if that is  
the case, to have that information communicated to him  . 
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This was originally procured via G-cloud 12 framework. 
 

c. What date was the agreement signed? 
Current agreement signed 25/06/2025 and effective from 01/07/2025 . 

 
d. When does the contract expire? 

     30/06/2026 with two optional extensions . 
 

4.   If you use a patient portal for some or all of your patient communications: 
a. As of September 2025, who is your patient portal or NHS app supplier:  

Cisco 
 

b. What month and year did your patient portal or NHS app go live for online communications: 
         Month  /  Year 

       April 2022 . 
 

c. As of September 2025, what is the total number of patients registered to receive online 
communications via your patient portal or NHS app:  
This is not an held information . Our service users do not need to register to receive online 
communications as they are sent a secure URL to access and view 1 .  
 

d. What percentage of letters submitted to your hybrid mail provider were first passed into the 
NHS app (i.e. the letter was not read in the app by the intended recipient): % 
0% - we are currently not live with a PEP to surface our information on the NHS App 
 

e. Does your hybrid mail supplier charge you for passing letters into your NHS app:  
Yes / No 
N/A 
 

f. What were the total number of letters sent and read by patients via your patient portal or 
NHS app between 1st October 2024 - 30th September 2025 (i.e. read online):  
We do not hold this information 1 . 
 

5. As of 2025, who manages digital transformation initiatives? 
      Name:  
      Phone:  
      Email Address: 

          Our Head of Digital Delivery manages this . 
 In an effort to ensure that the Trust does not receive unsolicited communications resulting in 
direct  
marketing purposes and/or any potential malicious malware, the Trust does not routinely publish 
the names or contact details of staff other than those publicly available through our Trust website 
as exercised in individuals GDPR rights. 

 
6.       As of 2025, who is your print room manager / manager of mailing operations? 

Name: 
Phone:  
Email Address: 
We do not have a print room .  
 

7. As of 2025, who manages procurement for print and post solutions? 
Name: 
Phone: 
Email Address: 

https://www.hpft.nhs.uk/about-us/our-board-of-directors/


Please see response to question 5 . 
 

Should you require further clarification, please do not hesitate to contact me. 
 
Please find enclosed an information sheet regarding copyright protection and the Trust’s complaints 
procedure in the event that you are not satisfied with the response. 
 
Yours sincerely 

 
D. Anthony 

Deborah Anthony 
 
Information Rights Officer 
 
Enc: Copyright Protection and Complaints Procedure Information Leaflet. 
 
If you would like to complete a short survey in relation to your Freedom of Information request please click here. 
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