
 

 

 
 
 
19 September 2025 
 

Information Rights & Compliance Team 
99 Waverley Road 

St Albans 
Hertfordshire 

AL3 5TL 
 

Tel:  01727 804227 
Email: Hpft.foi@nhs.net 

 
Our Ref: FOI/05775 

 
 
 
Thank you for your request concerning ADHD and autism assessments. 
 
Your request has been considered and processed in accordance with the requirements of the Freedom of 
Information (FOI) Act 2000. 
 
1. Please provide your total annual spend and total number of patients (for each of the last three 
financial years) on ADHD and Autism assessments, broken down by age categories as listed below. 
 
      Dear Hertfordshire Partnership University NHS Foundation Trust 

 
1 Section 1(1) Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled (a) to be informed in  
writing by the public authority whether it holds information of the description specified in the request, and (b) if that is  
the case, to have that information communicated to him. 

TOTAL  Apr-22-Mar-
23 

Apr-23-
Mar-24 

Apr-24-Mar-25 

ADHD 
assessments 
– patients 18 
years old and 
over 

Total 
number of 
patients 

We do not 
hold this 
information  in 
a reportable 
manner 1 

211 164 

Total annual 
spend 

We do not hold this information as we don’t have a 
separate spend for ADHD assessments 1  

ADHD 
assessments 
– patients 
<18 years old 

Total 
number of 
patients 

We do not 
hold this 
information in 
a reportable 
manner 1 

385 385 

Total annual 
spend 

N/A 

mailto:Hpft.foi@nhs.net


 
  CAVEAT : The data provided for ADHD is for non-complex service users only that were 

on the centralised waiting list . 
 

2.  For Apr-24-Mar-25, please split out the total number of patients / annual spend from question 1 
by those delivered in-house vs those delivered by third party private providers* (for Apr-24-Mar-
25). Please use one row for each third party private provider and please also include the 
pathway / contract type for each third party private provider (e.g. block contract, right to 
choose): 
Provider  Apr-24-Mar-25 

Pathway ADHD – 18 
years old 
and over 
patient 
numbers 

ADHD – <18 
years old 
patient 
numbers 

Autism – 18 
years old 
and over 
patient 
numbers 

Autism – 18 
years old 
patient 
numbers 

Total 
annual 
spend 

Example: 
Provider A 

 
       We are also unable to split the spend and the number of patients by the 
breakdown above .       Example: 

Provider B 

Example: 
In-house 
delivery 

Total 
(should 
align with 
question 1 
total for 
Apr-24-
Mar-25) 

 

Autism 
assessments 
- patients 18 
years old and 
over 

Total 
number of 
patients 

565 696 573 

Total annual 
spend 

We do not hold this information as we don’t have a 
separate spend for ASD assessments1 

Autism 
assessments 
- patients <18 
years old 

Total 
number of 
patients 

The ASD diagnostic service for children is provided and 
managed by Hertfordshire Community NHS Trust1. 

Total annual 
spend 



3. For Apr-24-Mar-25, please provide your total annual spend on the following post-diagnostic 
services. Please find definitions for post-diagnostic services at the end of the request.  Please 
include volumes where your Trust / Health Board has commissioned third party provider(s) to 
deliver the service. 

 
Annual spend Prescriptions Medication Therapies Psychoeducation Other 

support 
services 

ADHD – 
patients 18 
years old and 
over 

We do not have a separate spend for post-diagnostic services. 

ADHD – 
patients <18 
years old 

Autism - 
patients 18 
years old and 
over 

Autism - 
patients <18 
years old 

 

4.What is the FTE of employed clinicians in the Trust / Health Board who can conduct ADHD / Autism 
assessments, or prescribe ADHD medications? If possible, please split by role type. Please provide 
answers based on FTE (rather than headcount). Please exclude vacancies. 

Hertfordshire Partnership University NHS Foundation Trust is a provider of mental health and specialist 
learning disability services and , as such , we do not employ Paediatricians  . 

   We do not hold this information as we are unable to split the FTEs by the breakdown above  1. 
 

5. Please provide the current number of patients, that are currently waiting for an ADHD or 
Autism assessment at your Trust / Health Board. Please also provide the average (mean) 
time spent on the wait list before receiving an assessment at your Trust / Health Board. 
Please include the date which your figures are based on.  

 

 ADHD assessments Autism assessments 



Number of patients  
(18 years old and over) 

1346 waiters – both complex 
and non-complex 

1270 

(as of 15 /08/2025) 

Average wait time 
(18 years old and over) 

For non-complex SU seen 
on the centralised list ONLY: 

2025 – the average wait has 
been 833 days.  

2024  - 506 days 

2023 – 327 days 

582 days 

Number of patients  
(<18 years old) 

2864 

(as of 18/07 /2025) 

We do not hold this 
information  .1 

Average wait time 
(<18 years old) 

We do not hold this information. 1 

 
 

 
 

Should you require further clarification, please do not hesitate to contact me. 
 
Please find enclosed an information sheet regarding copyright protection and the Trust’s complaints procedure 
in the event that you are not satisfied with the response. 
 
Yours sincerely 
 
Deborah Anthony 
Deborah Anthony 

 
Information Rights Officer 
 
Enc: Copyright Protection and Complaints Procedure Information Leaflet. 
 
If you would like to complete a short survey in relation to your Freedom of Information request please click here. 
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