
 

 

 
 
 
19 August 2025 
 

Information Rights & Compliance Team 
99 Waverley Road 

St Albans 
Hertfordshire 

AL3 5TL 
 

Tel:  01727 804227 
Email: Hpft.foi@nhs.net 

 
Our Ref: FOI/05713 

 
 
 
Thank you for your request concerning temporary staffing data. 
 
Your request has been considered and processed in accordance with the requirements of the Freedom 
of Information (FOI) Act 2000. 
 
Under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, I would like to request the following information 
relating to temporary staffing at HPFT, covering the following staff groups: 

Community Psychiatric Nurses (CPNs) 
Registered Mental Health Nurses (RMNs) 
Registered General Nurses (RGNs) 
Occupational Therapists (OTs) 
Pharmacists 
 
Caveat: We do not distinguish at a coding level between Registered Mental Health Nurses (RMNs) 
& Registered General Nurses (RGN).  Community Psychiatric Nurses (CPNs) are not an 
occupational group and so they come under the Registered Mental Health Nurses (RMNs) and 
Registered General Nurses (RGNs).  For these reasons, nursing spend is shown as one group 
only.  They will almost exclusively be RMNs not RGNs.  Some of the group will be CPNs and others 
will be in other types of roles.  These are not distinguishable at this level. 

 
 
1 – Agency Spend 
Please provide the total agency spend for the last full financial year (or the most recent available 
12-month period) for each of the above staff groups. 
 
1)  

Staff groups Spend (£) 
Nurses £3,966k 
Occupational Therapists (OTs) £68k 
Pharmacists £71k 

 
 
 

2 – Agency Hourly Charge Rates 
For each staff group, please provide the following: 
 
The average hourly charge rate paid to agencies 
The highest hourly charge rate paid 
The lowest hourly charge rate paid 
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We consider the breakdown of agency rates to be commercially sensitive under Section 43(2) of the 
Freedom of Information Act .   
 
The information is exempt if disclosure would, or would be likely to prejudice the commercial interests of 
any person, including the public authority holding the information.  
 
This is a qualified exemption and therefore subject to the public interest test. We have considered the 
reasons for and against disclosure below: 
 
Reason for disclosure  
There is considerable interest in ensuring the Trust is transparent about its spending of public money at 
a time when public finances are under considerable scrutiny.  Currently there is significant interest in the 
Agency spend and ensuring value for money. 
 
Reason against disclosure 
The Trust is obliged to protect its commercial relationships with third parties; they must have confidence 
that their commercial information is secure when provided to us and the release of all their information 
would prejudice our on-going relationships.  
 
Conclusion 
We reached the view that on balance, the public interest is better served by withholding the rate supplied 
at under Section 43(2) of the Freedom of Information Act because by providing this information would 
identify unit / hourly costs and this may impact on our commercial interest including the economic interest 
of the procurement process when negotiations occur in the future. 
 
3 – Agency Supply and PSL Structure 
a. Please list the recruitment agencies currently supplying the Trust for these staff groups. 
b. Please confirm which agencies are on your Preferred Supplier List (PSL). 
c. Please outline how your PSL operates, including: 
 
Whether it is tiered 
Which agencies are on which tiers 
How shifts are distributed between agencies 
 
The Trust utilises all the agencies registered with NHS Workforce Alliance Framework.  
 
4 – Breakdown of Agency Spend and Hours Worked For each recruitment agency supplying staff, 
please provide: 
 
The total spend with that agency in the last full financial year (or most recent 12-month period) 
The total number of hours worked by agency staff from that supplier during the same period 
 
We are unable to provide you with the breakdown of total spend per agency and total number of hours 
worked by that agency as this information is not recorded in a reportable manner.  To provide this 
information would invoke S12 - cost of compliance exceeds the appropriate limit because we would need 
to manually go through every invoice. 
 
5 – Bank Staffing 
a. Please provide the total spend on internal bank staff for the last full financial year, broken 

down by the above staff groups. 
 

 Spend (£) 
Nurses 7,879k 
OTs 298k 



Pharmacists 36k 
 

 
b. Please provide the average hourly rate paid to bank workers in each group. 
 
Bank pay rates are paid in accordance with NHS pay scales.  
 
6 – Internal Temporary Staffing Team 
Please confirm the annual cost of running the internal temporary staffing/recruitment team, 
including salaries, overheads, and any relevant platform/technology costs. 
 
The total cost of the bank team was £291,318 in 24/25. 
 
7 – NHSP Spend 
Please confirm the total spend with NHS Professionals (NHSP) for the last full financial year (or 
most recent 12 months). 
 
We do not hold this information as we do not utilise NHSP.1 
 
Should you require further clarification, please do not hesitate to contact me. 
 
Please find enclosed an information sheet regarding copyright protection and the Trust’s complaints 
procedure in the event that you are not satisfied with the response. 
 
Yours sincerely 
 
Deborah Anthony 
Deborah Anthony 
 
Information Rights Officer 
 
Enc: Copyright Protection and Complaints Procedure Information Leaflet. 
 
If you would like to complete a short survey in relation to your Freedom of Information request please click here. 
 

 
1 Section 1(1) Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled 
(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information of the description specified in the request, and 
(b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated to him. 
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