Thank you for your request concerning IT Systems.

19 September 2025

NHS

Hertfordshire

Partnership University
NHS Foundation Trust

Information Rights & Compliance Team
99 Waverley Road

St Albans

Hertfordshire

AL3 5TL

Tel: 01727 804227
Email: Hpft.foi@nhs.net

Our Ref: FOI/05831

Your request has been considered and processed in accordance with the requirements of the Freedom
of Information (FOI) Act 2000.
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. Digital Dictation

Name of supplier & product

Number of user licences

Procurement method (e.g., framework)

Contract start date

Contract expiry date (please specify fixed end date vs option to extend/rolling contract)

Total contract value (if available)

Integration with PAS/EPR (please specify if outbound only — e.g., patient demographics, clinic

work list — or outbound and inbound, e.g., document return)

Key internal stakeholder roleltitle
public access to information held by public authorities 2.

- The purpose of the Freedom of Information is to provide

However , you may find the Trust's website helpful as it provides contact information for some

management staff .

Desired features not currently delivered (optional)

Some of the information requested is already in the public domain . For response to 1ato 1 g, please

follow this link to FOI/05099 ' .

. Outsourced Transcription

Name of supplier & product
Procurement method (e.g., framework)

Contract start date

Average monthly volume of letters (if available)
Average monthly volume of lines (if available)
Total contract value (if available)

Key internal stakeholder rolel/title

Desired features not currently delivered (optional)
We do not currently use any outsourced transcription.

. Speech Recognition
Name of supplier & product

' Section 21 — Information is available through other means .

>

Our Fsalues

WelcomingK Respectful Professional


mailto:Hpft.foi@nhs.net
https://www.hpft.nhs.uk/
https://www.hpft.nhs.uk/media/7345/2024-03-28-5099-disclosure-log-final-response.pdf

b Number of user licences
¢ Procurement method (e.g., framework)
d Contract start date
e Contract expiry date (please specify fixed end date vs option to extend/rolling contract)
f Total contract value (if available)
g Integration with PAS/EPR (please specify if outbound only — e.g., patient demographics, clinic
work list — or outbound and inbound, e.g., document return)
h Key internal stakeholder role/title - Please see response to question 1h
i Desired features not currently delivered (optional) - N/A
For 3a to 3g, please follow this link to FOI/05099 .

4. Ambient Al Scribe
Name of supplier & product
Number of user licences
Procurement method (e.g., framework)
Contract start date
Contract expiry date (please specify fixed end date vs option to extend/rolling contract)
Total contract value (if available)
Integration with PAS/EPR (please specify if outbound only — e.g., patient demographics, clinic
work list — or outbound and inbound, e.g., document return)
e Pilot stage (if applicable, please specify supplier, pilot duration, and scope)
e Key internal stakeholder role/title
e Desired features not currently delivered (optional)
We do not currently use any Ambient Al Scribe.

5. Video Consultation

a Name of supplier & product

b Number of user licences

¢ Procurement method (e.g., framework)

d Contract start date

e Contract expiry date (please specify fixed end date vs option to extend/rolling contract)

f Total contract value (if available)

g Integration with PAS/EPR (please specify if outbound only — e.g., patient demographics, clinic
work list — or outbound and inbound, e.g., document return)

h Key internal stakeholder role/title - Please see response to question 1h
i Desired features not currently delivered (optional) - N/A
j Average number of video appointments per month/year — We do not hold this information 2.

k % of virtual/remote consultations conducted using video vs telephone - We do not hold this
information 2 .

For 5a to 5g, please follow this link to FOI/05552 for information on video consultation ' .

6. Health Information Systems
e PAS (Patient Administration System) - FOI/05695 '

e EPR (Electronic Patient Record) - FOI/05552 '

2 Section 1(1) Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled

(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information of the description specified in the
request, and

(b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated to him.


https://www.hpft.nhs.uk/media/7345/2024-03-28-5099-disclosure-log-final-response.pdf
https://www.hpft.nhs.uk/media/klri0vzy/2025-03-18-5552-disclosure-log-response.pdf
https://www.hpft.nhs.uk/media/ld0oy1em/2025-08-05-5695-disclosure-log-response.pdf
https://www.hpft.nhs.uk/media/klri0vzy/2025-03-18-5552-disclosure-log-response.pdf

e eDMS (Electronic Document Management System) -FOI/05532
e RIS (Radiology Information System) —
e LIMS (Laboratory Information Management System)
e e-Correspondence (e.g., Docman) -
Not applicable
e Hybrid Mail (e.g., Synertec, Healthcare Communications) - FOI/05356 '
e Patient Portal (e.g., Patient Knows Best) -FOI /05641 °

Should you require further clarification, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Please find enclosed an information sheet regarding copyright protection and the Trust's complaints
procedure in the event that you are not satisfied with the response.

Yours sincerely

Deborah Anthony
Deborah Anthony

Information Rights Officer

Enc: Copyright Protection and Complaints Procedure Information Leaflet.

If you would like to complete a short survey in relation to your Freedom of Information request please click here.


https://www.hpft.nhs.uk/media/53nlwc52/2025-01-31-5532-disclosure-log-response.pdf
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